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PROPOSED REHABILITATION PLAN 

ZANDBERG SANDPUT (PTY) LTD SECTION 102 AMENDMENT APPLICATION, ROBERTSON MUNICIPAL DISTRICT, WESTERN CAPE PROVINCE 

WC 30/5/1/2/2/87 MR & WC 30/5/1/2/2/10080 MR 

NOT TO SCALE 

Mining will gradually move 
into the extension area as 
the current MR area is mined 
and rehabilitated. 

At the extension area, in the 
medium term, rehabilitation 
will entail the continuous 
reinstatement and seeding 
of mined layers (brown and 
green polygons), and the 
management of weeds and 
invasive plant species.  

In the long term, 
rehabilitation will involve 
final landscaping of the site, 
the replacement of the 
topsoil on the final layer and 
the removal of the excavator 
and FEL prior to the 
submission of a closure 
application to the DMRE. The 
MR holder will further be 
responsible for the seeding 
of all rehabilitated areas.
   

   
  

 

 

 


